
1 An early 20th century pine tool chest together 
with one other, including contents

2 An assortment of framed and glazed prints and 
pictures to include a map of Warwickshire

3 A selection of framed and glazed watercolours 
together with a mirror

4 An Oertling precision scale set

5 A DEC digital professional 380 computer to 
include tower, monitor and keyboard

6 A steel hanging outdoor candle holder

7 A Namron wetsuit

8 A selection of framed and glazed prints and oil 
paintings to include landscape scenes

9 A resin relief artwork of elephants signed 
Lindiwe

10 A large ornate gilt framed wall mirror

11 Two large modern mirrors

12 A mid-20th century dark Ercol armchair

13 A set of Ladderax

14 An oil on canvas of dancers signed bottom left

15 An oil on canvas of coastal scene

16 A watercolour of town scene signed bottom right

17 A mid-20th century teak sideboard by Everest

18 A mid-20th century teak magazine rack

19 A modern embroidered artwork

20 An oil and pastel drawing of a nude

21 A mid-20th century teak chest of five drawers

22 An Ercol three seat sofa together with matching 
armchair and footstool

23 An oil on board of farm building signed bottom 
left A Davies

24 A mid-20th century G Plan dressing table (minus 
mirror)

25 A dark Ercol coffee table with magazine rack

26 A mid-20th century teak tea trolly

27 A Schreiber dining table together with a set of 
four matching chairs

28 A Schreiber coffee table

29 A blue fabric upholstered pouffe

30 A mid-20th century teak dining table together 
with a set of six chairs with corded seats

31 A mid-20th century circular wall mirror

32 A gent's Claud Butler touring bike

33 A small selection of prints together with mirror

34 A selection of prints to include cricket

35 Two modern painted mirrors

36 A framed and glazed signed poster for 'Golden 
Eye'

37 A selection of prints and pictures of various 
subjects

38 An artist's proof print of a reclining nude after 
Spencer Roberts

39 A painted relief plaque of a Roman emperor

40 A Victorian mahogany drop-leaf work table 
having two full length drawers

41 An early 20th century mahogany inlaid aneroid 
barometer

42 An oil on paper of sailing vessels

43 Two Japanese wood block prints

44 A 19th century print of Wadham College 
together with one similar of The Hall at Wadham 
College

45 A Victorian mahogany chest of two short over 
three long drawers

46 An early 20th century brass framed mirror

47 A mahogany revolving open bookcase over 
cupboard

48 A small engraving of College Glen after C 
Hodgson

49 A limited edition print 'Beach Huts - Wells-Next-
The-Sea' signed Lewis '95

50 A continental marble topped commode chest of 
two drawers (A/F)

51 A 19th century oil on canvas of a river scene 
verso 'On the Leigh Brook' by Fred Taylor 1877

52 A very large early 20th century ash 
housekeeper's cupboard

53 An early 20th century mahogany and satinwood 
banded marble topped washstand

54 A 19th century copper coal bucket with lion 
masque handles and paw feet together with a 
brass coal scuttle

55 A limited edition print 'Innocent Until Proven 
Guilty' No. 289 of 850

56 A large framed and glazed early 20th century 
print 'Foot Ball'

57 A late 19th century Vienna wall clock, the dial 
marked 'G B'

58 A mounted collection of West African items to 
include Manilla, hair comb, coinage etc.
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59 An Edwardian mahogany chest of two short over 
one long drawer

60 A framed and glazed possible watercolour of a 
woodland scene signed bottom right Briigner

61 A 19th century oil on canvas of a ruined building 
on a lake (A/F)

62 An 'East India Company' pub style mirror

63 A reproduction gilt wood bevel glass regency 
design wall mirror

64 An Edwardian mahogany inlaid drop-leaf trolly

65 An early 20th century brass log bin with lion 
masque handles and paw feet together with an 
early 20th century brass fire screen

66 A Victorian pine chest of two short over two long 
drawers (A/F)

67 A large late 19th century double weight Vienna 
wall clock, the dial signed 'G B'

68 A late 19th century stripped pine dressing table 
(A/F)

69 An ornated framed oil on canvas of woodland 
scene signed bottom right

70 A reproduction print on glass titled 'Rubuan un 
Roufin'

71 A large pine mirror of architectural form

72 A pair of 19th century watercolours of lake 
scenes

73 A pine framed wall mirror with shelf

74 A cased Singer sewing machine (no key)

75 A Victorian stripped pine wash chest

76 A pair of modern oils on canvas of woodland 
scenes

77 Modern full height oak bookcase with pair of 
doors to base

78 A 1930s walnut cased wall clock

79 An early 20th century oak occasional table with 
lift-up lid together with one larger table

80 Three framed and glazed 'Wills Cigarette Card' 
collections to include ships, soldiers and famous 
actors

81 A pair of framed and glazed oils of lake scenes

82 An early 20th century oak framed seagrass 
seated stool

83 A late 19th century ebonized child's chair

84 An early 20th century oak chest of three long 
drawers

85 A framed and glazed print of Thomas Shelton 
together with one of 'Famous English Football 
Players 1881'

86 A Black Forest style aneroid barometer and 
thermometer

87 A map of the county of Cambridge together with 
a reproduction Blaeu wall map

88 An early 20th century oak dressing chest of two 
short over one long drawer

89 A cast metal fire implement holder in the form of 
a golfer

90 A pair of framed and glazed abstract prints 
signed bottom right A.McAndrews

91 An early 20th century display cabinet

92 A modern stick effect table lamp

93 A modern resin oval framed mirror

94 A set of early 20th century oak bookshelves

95 An oak hall seat comprising of mirrored back, 
telephone slide and stool with storage

96 An Old Charm style oak blanket box of small 
proportions

97 An early 20th century oak drop leaf table with 
barley twist supports

98 A mid-20th century oak drop coaching style 
table together with one other

99 A Victorian ebonised oak corner chair with rush 
seat and spindle back

100 An Arts & Crafts oak occasional table

101 An oak open bookcase

102 An oak bedroom chest of three drawers

103 A reproduction oak coffer with two drawers 
under

104 A Victorian pine and metal bound trunk

105 A Victorian pine kitchen table on square tapering 
supports

106 An antique oak single door corner cupboard on 
turned supports

107 An oak 4' 6" high open bookcase

108 An oak cased grandmother clock with striking 
movement

109 An Edwardian inlaid walnut music cabinet on 
square tapered supports and spayed feet

110 A Philco Bakelite radiogram

111 A late Victorian walnut and burr walnut cylinder 
desk with three drawers under
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112 A pair of Edwardian single chairs with carved 
and pierced top rail and splat on turned legs

113 A 19th century armchair upholstered in green 
material on a painted mahogany frame

114 An American style walnut rocking chair

115 A stained beech and cane work open armchair

116 An Edwardian stained beech nursing chair in a 
green button back fabric

117 A late Victorian walnut pedestal desk of seven 
drawers with tooled leather top

118 A child's 19th century stained beech and rush 
seat corner chair

119 A Victorian beech and elm seat Windsor 
armchair

120 An Edwardian carved walnut chair for 
reupholstery

121 A Victorian beech and rush seat rocking chair

122 A 19th century oak and rush seat high back 
chair

123 A late Victorian oak tamber door office unit 
enclosing ten internal drawers

124 A Victorian oak and elm seat open arm stick 
back chair (A/F)

125 A two metre by one metre rectangular oriental 
rug with a red ground

126 A pine bedroom chest of two over four drawers

127 A brass finish table lamp with shade

128 A Singer hand operated sewing machine with 
case

129 A modern walnut finish mirrored back dressing 
table with three drawers and matching stool

130 A mid-20th century rectangular coffee table with 
magazine shelf

131 An Alfred Cox mahogany sideboard with two 
cupboards and three central drawers

132 A reproduction mahogany finish what-not

133 An early 20th century oak cased drop dial wall 
clock

134 A modern beech and ply bentwood coffee table 
possibly by Stressless

135 Two modern pine coffee tables

136 A silvered glass base table lamp with shade

137 A reproduction glass effect rectangular cheval 
mirror

138 A mid-20th century mahogany draw-leaf dining 
table with a set of four matching chairs in 
upholstered brown fabric (possibly Alfred Cox)

139 A set of six rattan effect conservatory chairs

140 A Victorian stained pine blanket box

141 An early 20th century oak draw-leaf dining table

142 A Victorian stained beech an cane seat child' 
chair and an oak and rush seat stool

143 Ten oak and rush seat slat-back chairs

144 A pair of pine three drawer bedside chests

145 An oak bedside cabinet with slide

146 A mid-20th century Formica topped drop leaf 
kitchen table

147 A Victorian pine blanket box (A/F)

148 A painted lift-top trunk

149 A pair of Edwardian rush seat bedroom chairs

150 An early 20th century ash and elm seat stick-
back Windsor chair

151 A cane laundry basket

152 A set of three black painted bentwood style 
chairs

153 A rattan effect conservatory suite comprising two 
seat sofa, two chairs and a glass topped coffee 
table

154 An unusual chair with a Union Jack design 
upholstery

155 A Victorian mahogany rectangular stool

156 A reproduction mahogany effect filing cupboard 
with tooled leather insert to top

157 A mid-20th century carved teak blanket box, the 
geometrical panels with signature Ann Walters

158 A one metre by 1.5 meter Afghan rug (in two 
pieces)

159 An oriental square coffee table on turned 
supports

160 Three leather travelling cases and one similar 
small case

161 A set of four mahogany and Rexine seat mid-
20th century dining chairs

162 A walnut and glass topped rectangular coffee 
table with magazine rack below

163 A surveyor's level in carrying case with tripod

164 A James Seccombe PVC bedstead

165 A driftwood lamp base with shade

166 A modern pine bedside chest of three drawers
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167 a modern pine coffee table with end drawer and 
glass top

168 A beech lift-top school desk and chair

169 A cane log basket

170 A pair of bentwood correction chairs (A/F)

171 A modern pine break front sideboard by Ducal

172 A pair of polished metal reproduction table lamp 
bases

173 A Ducal pine bureau, the fall front over shallow 
drawer and two cupboard doors

174 A mid-20th century frameless mirror with 
attached planters

175 A reproduction stripped pine corner cabinet with 
mural (dog)

176 A hand crafted ply and pine toy box

177 A modern pine rectangular dining table

178 A wooden CD rack

179 A reproduction pine bedside table with single 
drawer

180 A framed and glazed limited edition print 'The 
Northamptonshire Cricket Team'

181 A 1950s kitchen maid (A/F)

182 A metalwork wine rack

183 A mid-20th century teak double door cupboard 
together with a matching three drawer chest

184 A mid-20th century teak double door cupboard 
together with a matching three drawer chest

185 A framed and glazed limited edition print 'British 
Record Barbel'

186 A mid-20th century teak oval extending dining 
table with a set of six (four plus two) matching 
chairs

187 A nest of G Plan teak coffee tables

188 A teak finish rectangular coffee table

189 A framed and glazed pastel drawing 'The 
Meeting'

190 A mid-20th century teak sliding door cupboard 
with bureau fitment

191 A reproduction pine over mantle mirror

192 A pair of teak G Plan cabinets with two doors 
and free storage

193 A painted Lloyd Loom laundry basket

194 A mid-20th century teak sideboard with three 
cupboards and three drawers

195 A nest of three teak tables on square tapered 
supports

196 A pair of cast metal bar stools

197 A teak open bookcase with two central drawers

198 A Worcestershire Farmer's packing case

199 A mid-20th century teak sideboard with drop 
down cupboard and drawer

200 An executive office chair in black vinyl

201 A chrome framed and black vinyl open arm 
office chair

202 Two early 20th century metal bound travelling 
trunks

203 A Titan 150bar pressure washer in box

204 A collection of garden tools

205 A circular wall mirror with bevelled mirror 
surround

206 A Makita JR3050T 110V reciprocating saw in 
case together with a Makita CL183D cordless 
vacuum cleaner (no battery or charger)

207 Two boxes of Icarus flatpack office furniture

208 A Winmau dart board

209 A Vax vacuum cleaner with tools

210 A Beko 8kg condenser sensor dryer

211 A BEM101 dehumidifier

212 A Hoover 8+5 kg 1400rpm automatic 
washer/dryer

213 An LG Electrocool fridge freezer

214 An Amazon Basics portable photographic studio

215 A Chemsearch garden sprayer

216 A box of miscellaneous items including 
carpenters toolbox, tools, lighting, shelves etc.

217 A Challenge single phase Demolition hammer 
drill

218 A teak effect two drawer low cabinet

219 A Titan 1800W pressure washer

220 A mahogany and brass mounted Nottingham fly 
fishing reel

221 A pair of Royd teak effect cased speakers

300 An Ibanez Talmar electro/acoustic guitar with 
hard case

301 A reproduction resin lamp in the form of two 
lovers

302 A pair of Carlton ware vases decorated with a 
floral spray
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303 An early 20th century arts and crafts tray with 
applied rosettes

304 A carved hard wood model of dragon

305 A blue and white oriental plate together with an 
oval oriental style plate with fashion decoration

306 Three stoneware storage vessels, two bearing 
maker's names

307 A collection of brass models to include vases, 
eagles, cannons, etc

308 Two Chinese design porcelain jugs decorated 
with figures and auspicious objects

309 A pair of 19th century silks, one of hunting 
scene, the other of rowing scene

310 A pair of 19th century Chinese plates decorated 
with foodogs

311 An early 20th century oak cased canteen of 
silver plated cutlery

312 Two cut crystal fruit bowls

313 A part Belvin canteen of silver plated cutlery

314 A Dartington crystal cranberry glass vase

315 A collection of Royal Horticultural Society 
collector's plates together with a selection of 
thimbles and display rack

316 A large selection of unframed artworks to 
include portraits of people and animals, etc

317 A pair of early 20th century Japanese Satsuma 
vases

318 A pair of Staffordshire fireside spaniels

319 A Capodimonte style figurine of Napoleon

320 A ceramic teapot depicting Leamington Spa 
Town Hall

321 A large Majolica jug

322 A 20th century Chinese brass foodog incense 
burner

323 A Royal Worcester figurine 'Catherine' together 
with a Royal Worcester figurine 'Caroline' and a 
Royal Worcester figurine 'Annabel'

324 A collection of resin figures of native Americans

325 Two brass figural groups of horses

326 An Italian ceramic figurine of a cockerel together 
with a pair of Crown Staffordshire models of 
cockatoos

327 A Royal Doulton figurine Litmore? part table 
service to include plates, cups, saucers, etc

328 A carved wooden plaque of water mammels

329 A 19th century brass mounted rosewood writing 
slope

330 A carved African ebony walking cane

331 A mid-20th century oriental parasol

332 A Junghans ATO electronic mantle clock

333 A mid-20th century pottery bowl with painted 
leaf design

334 A collection of mainly Staffordshire figurines to 
include couple, piper, etc

335 A Poole Pottery baluster vase with leaf design

336 A ceramic ashtray modelled after Winston 
Churchill together with a Portmeirion bottle

337 A collection of 19th century and later Chinese 
ceramic vases

338 Four items of art glassware to include vases

339 A prosthetic mould

340 A collection of decorative stained glass panels

341 A painted oak stand

342 A case containing collector's cars together with 
a boxed 1998 Hotwheels Ferrari F300, etc

343 A selection of unframed artworks to include 
Palace Of Westminster

344 A Beswick model of an owl together with a 
Beswick model of Peter Rabbit

345 A South American carved gourd

346 A Carlton Ware Hovis loaf design butter dish

347 A collection of ceramic, wooden, and resin 
models of animals to include cats, birds, etc

348 A 19th century Mary Gregory style decanter 
(A/F) (No stopper)

349 An early 20th century brass dial oak cased 
striking mantle clock

350 A resin bust of Sir John Franklin together with 
two other busts of homer and Hippocrates

351 A collection of art glassware to include vases, 
bowls, ewer, etc

352 Three carved wooden models of dragons

353 A set of three graduating aluminium models of 
sailing boats

354 A set of eight late 19th century cut glass wine 
goblets

355 A mid-20th century glass lamp together with a 
mid-20th century art glass lampshade

356 A Davidson style glass centrepiece with fish 
design
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357 A set of Noritake blue and white coffee cups and 
saucers

358 An early 20th century oak, metal, and fabric 
dressing table set

359 A spirit of ecstasy type car mascot together with 
two Rolls Royce hubcaps

360 Two mid-20th century mantle clocks along with a 
travelling clock

361 A collection of RSC performance posters and 
brochures

362 A Polynesian carved wooden mask

363 A pair of aluminium bookends in the form of 
knife, fork, and spoon sets along with two 
spanner design aluminium coat racks

364 A Unilectric Comptometer

365 A mid-20th century military style backpack with 
embroidered patches

366 A collection of modern film posters to include 
Star Wars, Austin Powers, and James Bond

367 A Chinese lacquered food carrier

368 Two late 19th/early 20th century miniature 
walnut desk chests

369 A mid-20th century chrome plated soda siphon

370 Four white ceramic models of horses along with 
one other

371 A pair of 19th century etched ruby glass lustres

372 A split cane fly rod and a vintage steel bait 
caster by Apollo with reel and case

373 A selection of fishing accessories to include 
scales, flys, models of fish , etc

374 A glass model of the Mary Rose in bottle

375 A selection of items to include copper kettle, 
driving gauntlets, postal scales, etc

376 A case containing a Pentax MZ50 camera and a 
selection of lenses

377 Two brass peacock fire screens

378 A folio of art of the world together with a 
selection of other photographs

379 A cast metal plaque of deer in woodland

380 A bronze model of a putto

381 A gilt metal model of a foo dog with ball

382 A pair of reproduction desk lamps with floral 
design glass lampshades

383 A collection of Hummel figurines to include boy 
on fence, teacher, etc

384 A collection of Swarovski crystal animals 
together with display case

385 A 20th century Japanese Satsuma tea set 
decorated with figures

386 A collection of early 20th century binoculars 
together with cameras and leather cases

387 Two lady's felted dress hats together with gloves

388 A metal deed box containing a large quantity of 
mostly mother of pearl buttons

389 A possible Jurassic era fossilised beach section

390 A collection of three unframed comical prints to 
include cricket

391 An oil on board of farmhouse scene bearing the 
signature Lines bottom right

392 A collection of Folio Society books to include 
'Far From The Maddening Crowd', 'The Wessex 
Tales', etc

393 Two wooden models of vintage cars

394 A selection of books to include Sir Walter Scott, 
Thackery, Thomas Hughes, etc

395 A collection of brass scientific sieves

396 A set of plated coasters together with a cast 
metal trivet stand

397 A gimbled military style compass in wooden box

398 A set of plated apostle spoons together with a 
set of plated fish knives

399 A box containing a small quantity of silver plated 
ware to include candelabras

400 A small selection of mainly framed and glazed 
prints to include silhouettes of animals

401 A box containing a silver plated community 
cutlery set

402 An early 20th century empty album

403 A collection of old wood working tools to include 
gap plane, brace, brace bits, etc

404 A set of Folio Society Jane Austen books

405 A set of Folio Society Charlotte Emily and Anne 
Bronte novels

406 A set of sixteen Charles Dickens books

407 A selection of hardback books to include 
R.L.Stevenson and A Conan Doyle

408 A set of Folio Society Sherlocke Holmes books 
and a complete set of - stories

409 A set of hardback novels by the Bronte sisters

410 A set of Folio Society books by E.M.Forster

411 A selection of hardback books on Shakespeare
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412 A set of sixteen hardback books by Charles 
Dickens

413 An RC racing car

414 A cast metal doorstop in the form of a pheasant

415 A box containing a selection of character jugs 
and similar

416 A white glazed terracotta model of a putti 
holding column

417 A box of auction catalogues to include Christie's, 
Bonhams, and Sotherby's

418 A set of early 20th century wooden skis together 
with boots and poles

419 A book of Aesop's fables illustrated by Edward J 
Eetmold together with 'The Water Babies' 
illustrated by Jessie Wilcox Smith

420 A scrapbook containing comical sketches, 
zoomorphic letters, etc

421 A doctor's blood pressure gauge together with a 
stethoscope, etc

422 An assortment of Cash's silks on various 
subjects

423 Two turned wooden truncheons together with an 
eastern leather covered club

424 A framed and glazed negative of Niagara Falls

425 A box containing an assortment of keyrings

426 A bag containing a quantity of mostly early 20th 
century currency

427 Two Maria Theresa thalers together with one 
other coin

428 A pair of 9kt gold and opal earrings

429 An early 20th century gold plated pocket watch 
by Elgin

430 Five painted Indian portrait plaques

431 A military compass together with a light meter, a 
pocket watch, and a wristwatch

432 A small quantity of Roman coinage

433 A quantity of mixed coinage and a bank note

434 A silver chronograph pocket watch (A/F)

435 Two cased cheroot holders

436 A bag containing an assortment of wrist and 
pocket watches

437 A box containing a collection of costume 
jewellery

438 A box containing an assortment of coinage to 
include Jubilee crown, coin sets, medals, etc

439 A selection of First World War silk postcards

440 A collection of RAOB jewels to include silver

441 An assortment of costume jewellery to include 
mainly brooches

442 Three pairs of cased sunglasses

443 A collection of items to include Princess Mary 
Christmas tin, wound dressing, mounted bullet 
displays, etc

444 A box containing silver and white metal items to 
include serving pieces, cup, salts, etc

445 An early 20th century brass and leather three 
drawer telescope

446 A box containing a large quantity of stamps, 
some being in albums

447 A box containing an assortment of silver plated 
ware to include teapot, tray, etc

448 A tray containing a selection of ceramic ware to 
include a part Royal Norfolk table service

449 A tray of paperback Penguin books

450 A tray containing assorted Meccano

451 A box of 45RPM records

452 A box of hardback books to include 'The Modern 
Physician'

453 A tray containing a quantity of boxed radio 
valves

454 A tray containing an assortment of silver plated 
and pewter ware to include tankards, trays, etc

455 A tray containing a collection of early 20th 
century teddy bears

456 A tray containing an assortment of items to 
include cloisonné napkin rings, ceramic jugs, 
binoculars, etc

457 A tray containing metalware to include copper 
coal bucket, carriage lamp, warming pan, etc

458 Two trays containing early 20th century dolls 
(A/F)

459 Two trays of hardback Agatha Christie novels

460 A tray containing assorted door furniture

461 A tray containing a selection of items to include 
mortar and pestle, models of animals, teapot, 
etc

462 A tray containing polished gemstones and 
geode slices

463 Two trays of assorted items to include Royal 
Doulton tableware, a soda siphon, wooden 
models, etc
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464 Three trays of mostly magazines and folders 
including history of the 20th century and the 
British Empire

465 A tray of assorted prints and picture frames

466 Three trays of mixed ceramic ware to include 
cabinet plates, slipware jug, tableware, etc

467 Three trays of assorted books to include 
Handyman In The Home and Private Eye

468 A tray containing Ordnance Survey maps

469 A tray containing various books

470 A Fortec Star digital satellite system comprising 
of sat box and dish

471 Two binding machines

472 Three trays of assorted hardback books to 
include antiques

473 Three trays of assorted hardback books to 
include Tennyson, etc

474 Three trays of assorted hardback books to 
include books on the Victorian Empire

475 Four trays of assorted hardback books to 
include the Iliad, works of Shakespeare, etc

476 Two trays of assorted ceramic ware to include 
Royal Worcester, Royal Copenhagen, etc

477 A tray containing Dartington crystal glassware

478 Three trays containing assorted hardback books 
to include Arthur Briant, Warwick County 
Records, etc

479 A tray containing mainly pewter drinking vessels 
and teapots

480 Two trays containing Folio Society books to 
include Greek myths, Anderson's fairy tales, 
Grimm's fairy tales, etc

481 Three trays containing Majolica style tableware 
to include Carlton ware

482 Four trays of hardback books to include 
Cassell's history of England, books on Winston 
Churchill, etc

483 Four trays of assorted ceramic tableware

484 Three trays of assorted hardback books to 
include reference books on the First World War, 
etc

777 *Withdrawn*
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